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Suspected bomber identified in 
1985 Rainbow Warrior 
bombing
October 2, 2006

Gerard  Royal,  brother  of  French 
presidential  hopeful  Ségolène  Royal, 
has been identified as a suspect in the 
1985 bombing of the Greenpeace ship 
Rainbow  Warrior.  There  were  two 
divers  who  planted  the  bombs  in 
Auckland  Harbour,  known  to  the 
police after they were photographed in 
the  South  Island  as  Alain  Tonel  and 
Jaques Camurier.

New  Zealand  Police  and  the  New 
Zealand Government say that they are 
probably not  going to  charge anyone 
else  even  if  they  confess  to  the 
bombing.  Two  people,  Dominique 
Prieur and Alain Mafart, were the only 
ones ever convicted in the bombing of 
the Rainbow Warrior.

Antoine  Royal,  brother  of  Segolene 
Royal said to Parisien newspaper: "My 
brother  Gerard was a  member of  the 
French  intelligence  sabotage  squad 
who  planted  the  bombs  on  the 
Rainbow  Warrior.  At  the  time, 
(Gerard) was a lieutenant and agent of 
the  DGSE  (intelligence  agency)  in 
Asia. He was asked in 1985 to go to 
New Zealand, to Auckland harbour, to 
sabotage the  Rainbow Warrior.  Later 
he told me that it was he who planted 
the bomb on the Greenpeace ship. He 
took a small craft with a second person 
to approach the boat."

In  1991  New  Zealand  made  a  deal 

with France to a stay of proceedings of 
those involved in the bombing.

Antoine added: "He was able to escape 
the  New  Zealand  authorities,  unlike 
the  false  Turenge  couple  who  were 
arrested.  My sister  learnt  that  he was 
present  during  the  operation  from  a 
recent article in the press."

Bunny McDiarmid, Greenpeace execu-
tive  director,  was  on  the  Rainbow 
Warrior when it was attacked and said: 
"I accept there is now little prospect of 
the  bomber  being  brought  to  justice. 
Those  responsible  are  getting  away 
with murder."

The bombing resulted in the death of 
one  man,  photographer  Fernando 
Pereira. Prieur and Mafart were prose-
cuted for the manslaughter of Pereira, 
they  pleaded  guilty.  Daughter  of 
Pereira,  Marelle,  said:  "My  dad  has 
been  murdered...I  don't  see  it  as 
manslaughter...I  don't  see  it  as 
accidental killing."

New Zealand man stopped at 
border because of unpaid fines
October 3, 2006

The  first  person  to  be  stopped at  an 
international airport because of unpaid 
fines  happened  yesterday  afternoon 
(NZDT) at the Auckland International 
Airport, New Zealand.

The  person,  who  wasn't  named,  was 
stopped because of the new legislation 
called  the  'Collection  of  Fines  at 
Airports' or more simply: Pay or Stay. 
He  was  forced  to  pay  NZ$3,750  in 

unpaid  reparations  since  1986.  "The 
person  intercepted  owed  $3,750  of 
reparation for an offence in 1986 and 
had  made  no  payments  since  late 
1987," said Rick Barker,  minister  for 
the courts in New Zealand.

"Once intercepted, the individual was 
given the option to pay the full amount 
owing.  He did  and was subsequently 
allowed to travel," Barker said.

The legislation  to  be  able  to  do  this 
was put into effect on September 28, 
2006.  The  legislation  states  that  if  a 
person owes any amount of money in 
reparation, fines in excess of $5,000 or 
there is  a warrant  out for their  arrest 
they will be stopped and forced to pay, 
withheld  from  travelling  or  will  be 
stopped  when  they  re-enter  the 
country.

The  fine-dodger  picked  up  today  at 
Auckland airport was exactly what the 
Government  wanted  to  achieve, 
according to Barker.

The  Pay  and  Stay  campaign  has 
currently  already  received  $10,000 
from  people  getting  ready  to  travel 
internationally. Barker said: "To avoid 
being  stopped  at  the  airport  the  best 
thing  to  do  is  simply  to  ensure  you 
have  no  major  unpaid  fines  or 
reparation before you pack your bags. 
I've  said  all  along  that  if  you  have 
enough money to travel overseas you 
have  enough  money  to  pay  your 
reparation  and  fines.  This  person 
obviously had the money, and it's only 
right  he  was  made  to  pay  what  he 
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owed."

Barker added:  "This person stood up 
in a court and said he was going to pay 
the victim of his crime reparation. He 
didn't follow this promise and... [after] 
19 years, he couldn't escape the border 
agency."

2,887 ecstasy tablets 
intercepted at New Zealand 
International Mail Centre
October 4, 2006

2,887  ecstasy 
(Methylenedioxymethamphetamine) 
tablets  were  intercepted  yesterday 
morning  (NZDT)  at  the  Auckland, 
New  Zealand  International  Mail 
Center  in  a  joint  operation  between 
New  Zealand  Customs  officials  and 
the  New Zealand Police.  The  tablets 
were being sent to a 32-year-old man 
living in Timaru from a man living in 
the United Kingdom. The Timaru man 
is  being  charged  with  importing  a 
class B drug, a controlled substance.

Altogether  the  tablets  had  a  street 
value of an estimated NZ$173,000.

The Timaru man has appeared in the 
Timaru District  Court  and will  be in 
custody until Thursday.

Bill  Perry,  Manager  for  Drug 
Investigations at  Customs, said:  "The 
parcel  was  posted  from  the  United 
Kingdom  to  an  address  in  Timaru. 
This  interception  highlights  New 
Zealand's  growing  problem  of  illicit 
drug importation."

So  far  during  2006  Customs  has 
intercepted  a  total  of  6,026  ecstasy 
tablets,  a  decrease  of  14,033  for  the 
year  of  2005  (20,059).  "However 
importations  of  ecstasy  and  other 
MDMA products  are  still  an  area  of 
ongoing  concern  and  monitoring  for 
Customs," said Perry.

The  International  Mail  Centre  is  the 

hub  for  all  mail  entering  or  leaving 
New  Zealand.  Each  month  the  mail 
center processes around three million 
incoming mail  items and around two 
and  a  half  million  outgoing.  Simon 
Williamson, Manager for the Northern 
Ports Customs, said: "Customs screens 
all  mail  entering the country using a 
range of methodologies including our 
officers'  skills  and  experience,  x-ray 
equipment  and  detector  dogs. 
Volumes  of  mail  are  rising  and 
Customs  officers  are  gearing  up  for 
the busy Christmas season."

During 2006 crystal methamphetamine 
seizures  by  Customs  have  risen  ten-
fold relative to the previous year.

Possible eruption at Ruapehu 
Volcano in New Zealand
October 5, 2006

A volcano alert has been issued after a 
moderate  2.8  magnitude  earthquake 
occurred at Mount Ruapehu last night 
at 10.30 p.m. (NZDT). The quake also 
broke  the  Crater  Lake  cable  which 
generated  a  call-out  from  the  lahar 
response team.

The  New  Zealand  Department  of 
Conservation  has  issued  a  high  risk 
warning  for  the  crater  at  Mount 
Ruapehu  and  Dave  Wakelin,  com-
munity relations officer for Tongariro-
Taupo, said: "The warning was issued 
Thursday  morning,  in  case  more 
volcanic activity follows."

It is yet to be confirmed if there was 
an eruption,  as poor weather made it 
hard  to  see  the  crater  from  plane. 
Craig  Miller,  vulcanologist  for 
Geological  and  Nuclear  Sciences 
(GNS Science), said: "I had hoped to 
see  if  the  lake  was  surrounded  by 
blackened snow. All we could see was 
cloud."  Steve  Sherburn,  duty 
vulcanologist  for  GNS Science,  said: 
"The cause of the alert would remain 
uncertain until the weather cleared and 

there could be a proper examination. 
Part  of  the  DOC  lahar  monitoring 
system appears to have been damaged 
at  the  time  of  the  earthquake  which 
suggests  there  may  have  been  an 
eruption,  but  other  monitoring  data 
says that any eruption must have been 
relatively  small."  If  there  was  an 
eruption it was probably only a small 
one.

The  alert  level  is  remaining  at  one, 
which  means  there  are  signs  of 
volcanic unrest.

Monitoring  of  Mount  Ruapehu  will 
continue.

This  was  the  first  reported  call-out 
since 1995.

Clint Brown, TV3 presenter, 
gives "unsatisfactory" letter of 
apology
October 6, 2006

Clint Brown, a sports presenter for 3 
News,  has  given  a  reportedly 
"unsatisfactory" letter of apology after 
he abused a taxi driver in Taupo while 
drunk.  The  taxi  driver,  Mere  Wall, 
was  verbally  abused  by  Brown  on 
September  13  where  he,  allegedly, 
called Wall a "Tuwharetoa whore and 
bitch,"  and  a  "Tainui  whore  and 
bitch."  Brown  was  then  punched  by 
the  partner  of  a  woman  he  had 
insulted.

Brown was admitted to hospital due to 
a broken eye socket and concussion.

Wall  had  asked for  an  apology after 
the incident. Brown sent an unsigned 
letter of apology to Wall, which Wall 
said she received last week. Wall said 
she was unhappy with the letter,  and 
has written to TV3 to complain.

Wall  said  that  the  letter  was  two 
paragraphs  long,  and  stated  that 
Brown cannot  remember the incident 
due  to  concussion,  but  if  he  did  do 
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something wrong then he is sorry. The 
letter  contained  no  return  address. 
Wall  hopes  to  get  a  better  apology, 
saying "I have written to TV3 [about 
the letter]."

Wall  admits  to  making  some 
comments  about  Brown  after  the 
incident,  Wall  said:  "But it  has gone 
on and on."

Brown  was  stood  down  after  the 
incident by TV3. Roger Beaumont,  a 
spokesman  for  TV3,  said  that  he  is 
still not back at work and it is unsure 
when,  or  if,  he  will  return.  "The 
investigation  is  still  continuing.  TV3 
and  police  were  investigating  the 
incident but it is not known how long 
the investigation would take."

The  New  Zealand  Police  is  yet  to 
charge Brown.

TV3  was  also  conducting  their  own 
investigation, which included hiring a 
private  investigator.  They  are  not 
ruling out any disciplinary action if the 
allegations are proved to be correct.
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